
Current  text  Text  should  read Observations  

2.0 We have agreed today on a 
set of commitments which apply 
to both refugees and migrants 
and refugees and also on sets of 
commitments for refugees and 
migrants respectively.    Some 
commitments, while mainly 
relevant to one category, may 
also be applicable to the other.    





2.3 Recognising that States have 
rights and responsibilities to 
manage and control their 
borders, we will implement both 
on arrival and return border 
management procedures, 
including disembarkation 
procedures and security and 
identification procedures, which 
are in conformity with applicable 
obligations under international 
law, including international 
human rights law and 
international refugee law.    We 
will ensure that public officials 
and law enforcement officers 
who work in border areas are 
trained to uphold the human 
rights of all persons crossing, uphs.7 (eTd
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2.5 We will continue to protect 
the human rights of all persons in 
transit and after arrival.   We will 
ensure that the immediate needs 
of persons who have been 
exposed to physical or 
psychological abuse while in 
transit are addressed on their 
arrival, without discrimination and 
without regard to legal or 
migratory status or means of 
transportation. 

 Support paragraph 

2.6 We are determined to 
address irregular or unsafe 
movement, without prejudice to 
the right to seek asylum, and to 
combat the exploitation, abuse 





2.10 We will ensure that our 
responses to large movements of 
refugees and migrants promote 
gender equality and the 
empowerment of women and 
girls and fully respect the human 
rights of women and girls.  We 
will combat gender-based 
violence in every way possible.  
We will provide access to sexual 
and reproductive healthcare.   
We will tackle the multiple and 
intersecting forms of 
discrimination to which refugee 
and migrant women and girls are 
subject.   And at the same time, 
recognizing the significant 
contribution and leadership of 
women in refugee and migrant 
communities, we will work to 
ensure their full and meaningful 
participation in the development 
of local solutions and 
opportunities.  We will take into 
consideration the different needs, 
vulnerabilities and capacities of 
women, girls, boys, and men. 

2.10 We will ensure that our 
responses to large movements of 
refugees and migrants promote 
gender equality and the 
empowerment of all  women and 
girls and fully respect their  
human rights of women and girls.  
We will combat sexual  and 
gender-based violence in every 
way possible.  We will provide 
access to sexual and 
reproductive healthcare.   We will 
tackle the multiple and 
intersecting forms of 
discrimination to which refugee 
and migrant women and girls are 
subject.   And at the same time, 
recognizing the significant 
contribution and leadership of 
women in refugee and migrant 
communities, we will work to 
ensure their full and meaningful 
participation in the development 
of local solutions and 
opportunities.  We will take into 
consideration the different needs, 
vulnerabilities and capacities of 
all women, girls, boys, and men. 

We feel it is important to address 
both sexual and gender based 
violence, which affects both men 
and women in the context of 
migratory movements.  







2.14 We recognize that refugees 
and 



Trafficking and Smuggling 
of Migrants, the ASEAN 
Plan of Action Against 
Trafficking in 



2.15 We favour an approach to 
addressing forced displacement 
and 



2.16


