


Thank you, Mr. Chairman, 

I have the honer to address this Committee today on behalf of the Association of 
Southeast Asian Nations (ASEAN), namely Brunei Darussalam, Cambodia, Indonesia, 
the Lao People's Democratic Republic, Malaysia, Myanmar, the Philippines, Singapore, 
Thailand, and Viet Nam. 

ASEAN associates itself with the statement of the Non-Aligned Movement. 

At the outset, allow me to warmly congratulate you and other members of the bureau on 
your election as Chair of the Sixth Committee. We assure you of our full cooperation, 
and are certain that under your able guidance this Committee will come to a successful 
conclusion. 

Mr. Chairman, 

The rule of law at the national and international levels is the cornerstone of friendly 
relations among nations, and the central basis of international cooperation and 
development. ASEAN, as a rules-based inter-governmental organization, strongly 
believes that rule of law is of utmost importance to the realization of globally-sustained 
economic growth, promotion of international peace, justice, and security, as well as 
protection of human rights. 

As a regional organization, ASEAN promotes intergovernmental cooperation and 
facilitates economic integration among its members. As such, rule of law at the national 
and international levels is very important to us, as it is the glue that binds us together. In 
this context, ASEAN welcomes this year's Sixth Committee debate on the topic with an 
outlook on "sharing national practices of States in the implementation of multilateral 
treaties," and we are delighted to share our experience with fellow delegations. We also 
look forward to the exchange of views on the other topic for this year's debate, 
"Practical measures to facilitate access to justice for all, including for the poorest and 
most vulnerable". 

Mr. Chairman, 

The ASEAN Charter and other of ASEAN's basic political documents embodyies the 
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• 

multilateral treaty processes, ASEAN set a major milestone in its regional economic 
integration, of forming the ASEAN Economic Community (AEC) in December of 2015, 
which comprises of the three community pillars, (1) Political-Security Community; (2) 
Economic Community; and (3) Socio-Cultural Community, with the Blueprints 2025 
serving as the guiding documents. 

Shaped and guided by 




